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Summary— This is an innovation paper entitled Collaborative Teaching Reading innovation which was implemented at Emilio J. Estipona
National High School during the 2022-2023 and 2023-2024 school years. The innovation aimed to tackle persistent reading challenges
among students by combining technology and stakeholder collaboration. Utilizing text-complexity software, the program generated cus-
tomized reading materials that aligned with individual student abilities, thereby addressing the frequent mismatch between text difficulty
and students’ reading levels. The initiative promoted teamwork among teachers, students, and parents, fostering a supportive network that
identified and addressed reading difficulties in real time. Data-driven tracking enabled targeted interventions, enhancing the efficacy of
teaching practices. Results showed marked improvements in reading comprehension, academic performance, and parental involvement,
demonstrating the innovation’s potential to support literacy advancement within the educational system.
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I. OVERVIEW

I n the landscape of basic education, several formidable
challenges persist, as illuminated by recent literature and

statistics. Among these challenges, the prevalence of reading
difficulties among students stands out as a significant hurdle
(The World Bank, 2019; UNESCO, 2017). Many learners
struggle with reading comprehension and fluency, impeding
their academic progress and overall educational experience
(Caraig Quimbo, 2022; Ludewig et al., 2022; Vaughn et
al., 2019). Compounding this issue is the limited involve-
ment of parents in their children’s education, which can fur-
ther hinder the support system crucial for addressing read-
ing challenges effectively (Cekiso et al., 2022; Pham Snow,
2021). Additionally, teachers often find themselves grap-
pling with the dual constraints of large classroom sizes and
limited resources, making it challenging to identify and cater
to the diverse needs of individual students. Furthermore, the
mismatch between the complexity of reading materials and
students’ abilities exacerbates the situation, as texts may ei-
ther prove too challenging or too simplistic, failing to engage
learners effectively (Rahmani, 2016).

Addressing these challenges presents a promising oppor-
tunity to positively impact not only the educational system
but also its stakeholders and the broader community. By
implementing solutions that tackle reading difficulties head-
on, educational institutions can anticipate a marked improve-
ment in academic performance and literacy rates among
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students. Moreover, fostering greater parental engagement
through collaborative teaching initiatives fosters a support-
ive learning environment at home, augmenting students’ mo-
tivation and academic outcomes. Equipping teachers with
the necessary tools and strategies to address reading chal-
lenges not only enhances their effectiveness in the classroom
but also contributes to their ongoing professional develop-
ment. Ultimately, a well-educated populace not only drives
economic development but also fosters social cohesion and
overall community well-being.

The innovation of Collaborative Teaching Reading, lever-
aging text-complexity software alongside the active involve-
ment of teachers, students, and parents, offers a multifaceted
approach to addressing the identified obstacles. Through the
customization of learning materials tailored to individual stu-
dents’ reading levels, the software mitigates the challenge
of mismatched text complexity, ensuring that materials are
appropriately engaging and accessible. Moreover, by fos-
tering collaboration among teachers, students, and parents,
the innovation promotes a cohesive support network wherein
stakeholders collectively identify and address reading diffi-
culties. Furthermore, the data-driven nature of the interven-
tion empowers teachers to track students’ progress and tailor
interventions accordingly, thereby maximizing efficacy and
impact.

In alignment with the vision, mission, and objectives of
the Department of Education, the innovation of Collaborative
Teaching Reading holds significant promise.

By enhancing learning outcomes through targeted inter-
ventions, the initiative contributes directly to the depart-
ment’s overarching goal of ensuring quality education for all.
Moreover, by promoting inclusivity and equity through col-
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laborative approaches, the innovation aligns seamlessly with
the department’s objective of fostering an inclusive educa-
tional environment wherein no student is left behind. Em-
powering teachers with the tools and resources necessary
to address student needs further reinforces the department’s
mission of enhancing teacher capacity and professionalism,
ultimately enhancing the overall quality of education provi-
sion.

The embodiment of core principles and values reflected
in the SDO’s mantra is evident throughout the innovation of
Collaborative Teaching Reading. By promoting collabora-
tion among stakeholders, the initiative underscores the value
of teamwork and partnership in addressing educational chal-
lenges effectively. Furthermore, by prioritizing equity and
inclusion, the innovation ensures that all students, regardless
of background or ability, have access to the support they need
to thrive academically. Finally, by empowering communities
through active parental engagement, the initiative embodies
the principle of community involvement in driving educa-
tional outcomes, thereby advancing the broader goals of the
SDO and fostering a culture of collective responsibility for
education.

II. INNOVATION DESCRIPTION

The innovation of Collaborative Teaching Reading is a
comprehensive approach to addressing reading difficulties
among students, integrating key stakeholders such as teach-
ers, students, and parents, alongside the utilization of text-
complexity software. At its core, the innovation revolves
around the generation and customization of learning mate-
rials tailored to individual students’ reading levels using ad-
vanced text-complexity software. These materials encom-
pass a range of reading materials, including texts, articles,
and exercises, designed to engage students and foster read-
ing comprehension and fluency. Additionally, the innovation
facilitates collaboration among stakeholders through various
platforms and communication channels, enabling teachers,
students, and parents to work together in identifying and ad-
dressing reading challenges effectively. Key features include
data-driven intervention strategies, real-time progress track-
ing, and ongoing support and resources for teachers, stu-
dents, and parents.

The innovation operates by leveraging technology and col-
laboration to address the identified challenges in basic educa-
tion, particularly reading difficulties among students. Text-
complexity software plays a central role in generating cus-
tomized learning materials tailored to individual students’
reading levels, effectively addressing the challenge of mis-
matched text complexity. By providing teachers with the
tools and resources to create personalized learning experi-
ences, the innovation ensures that students are appropriately
challenged and engaged in their reading activities. Moreover,
the collaborative nature of the initiative fosters a supportive
environment wherein teachers, students, and parents work to-
gether to identify and address reading difficulties, thereby en-
hancing the efficacy of interventions and support strategies.

Compared to existing solutions or approaches, the inno-
vation of Collaborative Teaching Reading offers several dis-
tinct advantages and unique capabilities. Firstly, the integra-
tion of text-complexity software enables the generation of

customized learning materials tailored to individual students’
reading levels, ensuring that materials are

appropriately challenging and engaging. Additionally, the
collaborative approach involving teachers, students, and par-
ents fosters a supportive learning environment wherein stake-
holders work together to address reading difficulties effec-
tively. Moreover, the data-driven nature of the intervention
enables teachers to track students’ progress in real-time and
tailor interventions accordingly, maximizing efficacy and im-
pact.

The innovation integrates various technologies, method-
ologies, and principles to achieve its intended outcomes.
Text-complexity software utilizes advanced algorithms to an-
alyze text complexity and generate customized learning ma-
terials tailored to individual students’ reading levels. Ad-
ditionally, the collaborative approach leverages communica-
tion platforms and channels to facilitate interaction and col-
laboration among teachers, students, and parents. Further-
more, the data-driven intervention strategies enable teach-
ers to track students’ progress and adapt interventions based
on real-time data, ensuring that support strategies are con-
tinuously refined and optimized to meet students’ evolving
needs.

III. INNOVATION STATEMENT

The innovation of Collaborative Teaching Reading aims to
achieve several primary goals and objectives within the ed-
ucational context. Firstly, the innovation seeks to improve
literacy rates and reading comprehension among students by
addressing reading difficulties effectively. By providing cus-
tomized learning materials tailored to individual students’
reading levels, the innovation aims to enhance students’ abil-
ity to engage with and comprehend various texts, articles, and
materials. Additionally, the initiative aims to foster a col-
laborative learning environment wherein teachers, students,
and parents work together to identify and address reading
challenges. This collaborative approach not only enhances
the support system available to students but also promotes
a sense of shared responsibility for student success among
all stakeholders. Moreover, the innovation aims to empower
teachers with the tools and resources necessary to address
reading difficulties effectively, thereby enhancing their ca-
pacity to meet the diverse needs of their students. Ultimately,
the overarching goal of the innovation is to ensure that all stu-
dents have access to quality education and support, regard-
less of their background or ability, thereby fostering inclusive
educational practices and equitable learning outcomes.

IV. IMPLEMENTATION PROCEDURE

a. Process Flow Framework

The process flow of the innovation of Collaborative Teach-
ing Reading involves several key steps or stages designed to
address reading difficulties among students collaboratively.
Firstly, the process begins with the assessment of students’
reading levels using standardized tests or assessments. Based
on the assessment results, the next step involves the uti-
lization of text-complexity software to generate customized
learning materials tailored to individual students’ reading
levels. These materials encompass a range of texts, articles,
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and exercises designed to engage students and foster reading
comprehension and fluency. Following the creation of these
materials, teachers facilitate the implementation of reading
activities in the classroom, providing guidance and support
to students as they engage with the materials. Additionally,
the process

involves active involvement and support from parents, who
play a crucial role in reinforcing learning at home and pro-
viding additional support to their children.

These steps interact and connect with each other seam-
lessly to facilitate the smooth functioning of the innovation.
The assessment of students’ reading levels informs the gener-
ation of customized learning materials using text-complexity
software, ensuring that materials are appropriately challeng-
ing and engaging for students. Teachers then utilize these
materials in the classroom, providing guidance and support
to students as they engage with the texts. Meanwhile, parents
are actively involved in their child’s education, providing ad-
ditional support and reinforcement at home. Throughout this
process, communication channels facilitate collaboration and
feedback among all stakeholders, ensuring that interventions
are tailored to students’ individual needs and effectively ad-
dress reading difficulties. This collaborative approach fos-
ters a supportive learning environment wherein teachers, stu-
dents, and parents work together to identify and address read-
ing challenges effectively.

Specific methodologies, tools, and techniques utilized
within the process flow or framework of the innovation en-
hance its efficiency and effectiveness. The use of text-
complexity software leverages advanced algorithms to ana-
lyze text complexity and generate customized learning mate-
rials tailored to individual students’ reading levels. This en-
sures that materials are appropriately challenging and engag-
ing, maximizing students’ comprehension and fluency. Ad-
ditionally, the data-driven nature of the intervention enables
teachers to track students’ progress in real-time and adapt in-
terventions accordingly, ensuring that support strategies are
continuously refined and optimized to meet students’ evolv-
ing needs. Furthermore, the collaborative approach fosters a
sense of shared responsibility for student success among all
stakeholders, promoting inclusivity and equity in education.
Overall, these methodologies, tools, and techniques work
synergistically to enhance the efficiency and effectiveness of
the innovation in addressing reading difficulties among stu-
dents.

b. Project Management

The innovation of Collaborative Teaching Reading is man-
aged through a coordinated effort involving various stake-
holders at different levels. Typically, the management of
the innovation involves educational administrators, such as
school principals or district supervisors, who oversee the im-
plementation of the initiative within their respective institu-
tions or districts. Additionally, there may be project man-
agers or coordinators responsible for overseeing the day-to-
day operations and ensuring that the innovation progresses
according to plan. Furthermore, teachers play a crucial role
in managing the innovation at the classroom level, as they
are responsible for implementing the reading activities and
collaborating with students and parents to address reading

difficulties effectively.
Several strategies and methodologies are employed in

project management to ensure the successful execution of
the innovation. Firstly, clear communication channels are es-
tablished to facilitate collaboration and feedback among all
stakeholders involved in the initiative. Regular meetings and
check-ins provide opportunities for stakeholders to discuss
progress, address challenges, and make any necessary ad-
justments to the implementation plan. Additionally, project
timelines and milestones are established to track progress and
ensure that key deliverables are met within specified time-
frames. Moreover, ongoing training and professional devel-
opment opportunities are provided to teachers and other team
members to enhance their capacity to implement the innova-
tion effectively.

The key stakeholders and team members involved in man-
aging and implementing the innovation include educational
administrators, project managers or coordinators, teachers,
students, and parents. Educational administrators oversee
the implementation of the initiative at the institutional or
district level, providing support and resources as needed.
Project managers or coordinators are responsible for over-
seeing the day- to-day operations of the initiative, ensuring
that it progresses according to plan and addressing any is-
sues that arise. Teachers play a central role in implement-
ing the innovation at the classroom level, facilitating reading
activities and collaborating with students and parents to ad-
dress reading difficulties effectively. Students are actively
involved in the implementation of the innovation, engaging
with the customized learning materials and participating in
reading activities. Finally, parents are crucial stakeholders in
the initiative, providing support and reinforcement at home
and collaborating with teachers to support their child’s ed-
ucational development. Each stakeholder has specific roles
and responsibilities within the management and implementa-
tion of the innovation, working together to achieve its goals
and objectives.

c. Timeline

The estimated timeline for the pre-implementation stage
of the Collaborative Teaching Reading innovation typically
spans several months, depending on the scale and complex-
ity of the initiative. During this stage, activities such as
planning, research, and resource gathering are conducted
to lay the groundwork for successful implementation. Ini-
tially, stakeholders engage in comprehensive planning ses-
sions to define the goals, objectives, and scope of the inno-
vation. This involves conducting research to identify best
practices and gather relevant data on students’ reading levels
and needs. Additionally, during this stage, resources such as
text-complexity software, training materials, and support re-
sources for teachers and parents are acquired or developed.
Overall, the pre-implementation stage is a crucial period for
laying the foundation for the successful execution of the in-
novation, typically lasting between three to six months.

The implementation stage of the Collaborative Teaching
Reading innovation is characterized by the active execution
of planned activities and strategies to address reading diffi-
culties among students. This stage typically spans an aca-
demic year or longer, depending on the duration of
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Fig. 1: Engaging Students, Teachers, Parents in Teaching Reading: The Process Flow

the intervention. Key tasks and milestones during the
implementation stage include the distribution of customized
learning materials to teachers, the facilitation of training ses-
sions for teachers and parents, and the initiation of reading
activities in the classroom. Additionally, checkpoints and
progress reviews are scheduled periodically to monitor the
implementation progress, assess the effectiveness of inter-
ventions, and make any necessary adjustments. Milestones
may include the completion of initial assessments, the imple-
mentation of reading activities, and interim progress reviews.
Throughout the implementation stage, ongoing communica-
tion and collaboration among stakeholders are essential to
ensure the smooth execution of the innovation and address
any challenges that may arise effectively.

The post-implementation phase of the Collaborative
Teaching Reading innovation focuses on ongoing evaluation,
refinement, and potential expansion of the initiative. Fol-
lowing the completion of the initial implementation period,
stakeholders engage in comprehensive evaluations to assess
the impact of the innovation on students’ reading outcomes
and overall educational experience. This may involve ana-
lyzing student performance data, conducting surveys or focus
groups, and gathering feedback from teachers, students, and
parents. Based on the evaluation findings, adjustments and
refinements are made to the intervention strategies, learn-
ing materials, and support mechanisms as needed to enhance
effectiveness. Additionally, stakeholders explore opportuni-
ties for potential expansion of the innovation to reach more
students or address additional educational needs. The post-
implementation phase is characterized by a continuous cycle

of evaluation, refinement, and expansion, ensuring that the
innovation remains responsive to the evolving needs of stu-
dents and stakeholders.

d. Resource Utilization

The creation and operation of the Collaborative Teaching
Reading innovation require a variety of primary resources,
including materials, technology, and human capital. Key ma-
terials include educational resources such as textbooks, arti-
cles, and exercises tailored to students’ reading levels, as well
as training materials for teachers and support resources for
parents. Additionally, technology plays a crucial role, par-
ticularly text- complexity software utilized to generate cus-
tomized learning materials. Human capital is also essential,
with teachers, educational administrators, project managers,
and support staff all contributing to the successful implemen-
tation of the innovation through their expertise and dedica-
tion.

The allocation and management of resources throughout
the development and implementation phases of the innova-
tion are typically handled with careful planning and coordi-
nation. During the planning stage, stakeholders assess re-
source needs based on the scope and objectives of the initia-
tive, ensuring that sufficient materials, technology, and hu-
man capital are available to support its execution. Resource
allocation decisions are informed by factors such as bud-
get constraints, availability of technology and materials, and
staffing requirements. Throughout the

implementation phase, resources are managed efficiently
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through ongoing monitoring and evaluation, with adjust-
ments made as needed to address any resource gaps or chal-
lenges that arise.

To optimize resource utilization and ensure cost-
effectiveness and sustainability in the long term, various
strategies and techniques are employed. Firstly, stakehold-
ers prioritize the use of cost-effective materials and tech-
nology solutions that offer the greatest impact on student
learning outcomes. Additionally, resource-sharing arrange-
ments may be established to maximize efficiency and mini-
mize duplication of efforts across schools or districts. Train-
ing and capacity-building initiatives are implemented to em-
power teachers and other stakeholders to utilize resources ef-
fectively and efficiently. Moreover, ongoing monitoring and
evaluation processes help identify opportunities for stream-
lining operations and reallocating resources as needed to ad-
dress emerging needs or challenges. Finally, sustainabil-
ity considerations are integrated into resource planning and
management efforts, with a focus on long-term viability and
scalability of the innovation to ensure its continued success
and impact.

e. Progress Monitoring

Monitoring the progress and outcomes of the innovation’s
implementation typically involves a collaborative effort
among various stakeholders, each with specific roles and re-
sponsibilities. Educational administrators, such as school
principals or district supervisors, often take on a leadership
role in overseeing the implementation of the initiative within
their respective institutions or districts. Their responsibili-
ties may include setting goals and objectives, coordinating
resources, and providing support and guidance to teachers
and other team members. Additionally, project managers
or coordinators may be tasked with monitoring the day-to-
day progress of the innovation, ensuring that key milestones
are met and addressing any issues or challenges that arise.
Teachers play a crucial role in monitoring student progress
and outcomes in the classroom, providing ongoing feedback
and assessment data to inform decision-making. Finally, par-
ents may also be involved in monitoring the implementation
of the innovation, providing feedback and support from the
home environment.

To track and evaluate the ongoing progress and outcomes
of the innovation, specific processes and methodologies are
employed to gather data and assess effectiveness. These may
include regular assessments of student performance, such
as standardized tests or formative assessments, to measure
improvements in reading comprehension and fluency over
time. Additionally, qualitative methods, such as surveys, fo-
cus groups, or interviews, may be utilized to gather feed-
back from teachers, students, and parents on their experi-
ences with the innovation and its impact on learning out-
comes. Data analysis techniques, such as statistical analysis
or trend analysis, may be applied to assess trends and patterns
in student performance data and identify areas for improve-
ment. Furthermore, ongoing monitoring and evaluation

processes are integrated into the overall project manage-
ment framework to ensure that progress is tracked consis-
tently and effectively.

Various tools and mechanisms are utilized for progress

monitoring, including software platforms, data analysis tech-
niques, and reporting systems, to facilitate effective oversight
and decision-making. Text-complexity software may be uti-
lized to generate customized learning materials and track stu-
dent progress in real-time, providing valuable data for on-
going assessment and intervention. Additionally, learning
management systems or educational platforms may be em-
ployed to facilitate communication and collaboration among
stakeholders and provide access to resources and support ma-
terials. Data analysis techniques, such as regression anal-
ysis or data visualization, may be applied to analyze stu-
dent performance data and identify trends or patterns. Re-
porting systems may be implemented to generate regular re-
ports on progress and outcomes, which can be used to inform
decision-making and guide future planning efforts. Overall,
these tools and mechanisms play a crucial role in facilitating
effective progress monitoring and decision-making through-
out the implementation of the innovation.

V. SUSTAINABILITY PLAN

Specific steps and actions are planned to sustain the imple-
mentation of the innovation in the future, ensuring its contin-
ued effectiveness and impact. These actions may include es-
tablishing a sustainability plan that outlines long-term goals,
objectives, and strategies for maintaining the initiative be-
yond the initial implementation period. This plan may in-
volve securing ongoing funding or resources to support the
ongoing operation of the innovation, as well as identify-
ing key stakeholders and partners who can provide support
and collaboration. Additionally, capacity-building initiatives
may be implemented to empower teachers and other stake-
holders with the skills and knowledge needed to sustain the
innovation over time. Finally, monitoring and evaluation pro-
cesses are established to track progress and outcomes, iden-
tify areas for improvement, and make any necessary adjust-
ments to ensure the sustainability of the initiative.

Sustainability actions are designed to address potential
challenges or risks that may arise post-implementation, en-
suring that the innovation remains effective and impactful in
the long term. By securing ongoing funding or resources,
the initiative can mitigate the risk of resource constraints
that may threaten its sustainability. Additionally, capacity-
building initiatives empower teachers and other stakehold-
ers to take ownership of the innovation and adapt it to meet
evolving needs and challenges. Regular monitoring and eval-
uation processes help identify any emerging challenges or
risks and provide opportunities for timely intervention and
adjustment to maintain the initiative’s effectiveness and rele-
vance.

Enhancement plans are intended to improve the inno-
vation’s effectiveness or efficiency over time, building on
lessons learned and feedback gathered during the implemen-
tation phase. These plans may involve refining existing pro-
cesses and methodologies, optimizing resource utilization, or
incorporating new technologies or best practices to enhance
outcomes. Capacity-building initiatives may be expanded to
provide ongoing training and support to teachers and other
stakeholders, ensuring that they have the skills and knowl-
edge needed to implement the innovation effectively. Addi-
tionally, partnerships with external organizations or experts
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may be established to bring in new perspectives and exper-
tise to further enhance the innovation’s effectiveness and ef-
ficiency.

Strategies proposed to further develop and refine the inno-
vation for better outcomes may include conducting research
and development activities to explore new approaches or in-
terventions that can augment the initiative’s impact. Collab-
oration with academic institutions or research organizations
may be pursued to evaluate the effectiveness of the innova-
tion and identify areas for improvement. Additionally, feed-
back mechanisms are established to gather input from stake-
holders on their experiences with the innovation and any sug-
gestions for improvement. This feedback is used to inform
ongoing refinements and adjustments to the initiative, ensur-
ing that it remains responsive to the evolving needs of stu-
dents and stakeholders.

Envisioning the desirable outcomes evolving as the inno-
vation continues to be implemented and refined involves en-
visioning a future where all students have access to qual-
ity education and support, regardless of their background or
ability. As the innovation matures, it is expected to yield
increasingly positive outcomes, such as improved literacy
rates, enhanced academic performance, and greater equity
and inclusivity in education. Additionally, the collabora-
tive approach fostered by the innovation is anticipated to
strengthen relationships among stakeholders and promote a
culture of shared responsibility for student success. Ulti-
mately, the ongoing implementation and refinement of the
innovation are expected to contribute to the long- term im-
provement of educational outcomes and the overall well-
being of students and communities.
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